Tax Claim Bureau of Mifflin County 2024 Upset Sale September 9, 2024

Results

Tax Map No. Property Owner Control # Property Location Starting Bid Final Bid
01,15-0170 Davis, Richard J 10 81077 214 N Grand St S 4,344.66 sold
04 ,02-0162 Trout, Ronald L, Patricia D Pierce & Linda Nist 40 781526 Logan St S 1,929.95 sold
04 ,02-0232 Kevoos Handyman Services LLC 40 781565 10 & 10 1/2 Valley St S 9,188.39 no bid
04 ,02-0410 Trego, Justin E 40 23114 47 Forsythe Ln S 4,709.80 no bid
04 ,05-0112 Stine, Gerald T 40 781825 9 Chestnut St Ext S 4,923.57 no bid
05,09-0121 Kise, Robert 50 12318 54 Catherine St S 3,730.24 no bid
06,02-0130 CMDS LLC 60 782915 18 W Charles St S 5,018.45 no bid
06 ,02-0308 CMDS LLC 60 2872 324 S Main St, Stes A/B/ ..... S 9,637.43 no bid
08 ,03-0306 Norris, Richard J & Donald E Wilson 80 783892 313 8th Ave S 5,858.00 sold
09,03-0303 Steve L Garman Properties LLC 90 2060 366 Cedar St S 3,153.26 no bid
09,03-0304 Steve L Garman Properties LLC 90 6422 360 Cedar St S 4,175.53 no bid
09,03-0317 Steve L Garman Properties LLC 90 2072 Behind 360-366 Cedar St S 1,164.87 no bid
09,03-0318A Steve L Garman Properties LLC 90 2073 Behind 374 Cedar St S 1,061.00 no bid
12,22-0101 Swartz, Donald R 120320465 |73 N Main St S 60,299.65 no bid
12 ,22-0219A Lash, Clair P Jr 120 31363 130 N Main St S 7,323.60 no bid
12 ,23-0305--,008 Treaster, Daryl J & Diane L 120 32545 15 Shawna Dr S 2,513.29 no bid
12 ,23-0719 Warner, Michael R 120 787222 15B St S 4,045.21 no bid
16,10-0100--,116 Grose, Thomas 160 135779 |32 Sunflower Ln S 2,738.19 no bid
16 ,20-0964A Weinberg, Allen & June 160 504079 |619 Parcheytown Rd S 2,406.09 sold
16,24-0305 Druckenmiller, Christopher David 160 64039 106 N Main St S 3,063.84 no bid
16 ,42-0048 laccarino, Edward 160 405032 |Land S 525.39 sold
17,12-0111--,012 Griffith, Mark 170 483036 Lot 204 S 492.79 no bid
19,09-0334 Wilson, Daulton 190 802151 |Land S 2,166.53 sold
19,13-01198B CMDS LLC 190 802454  [6289 US Hwy 522 S S 18,664.81 no bid
21,21-0520 Rudzinski, Ashley & Corey McCarty 21023732 20 Christoff Ln S 949.57 no bid
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